
Community Calendar

Monday, June 2, 2025

Crafters Circle : Craft and Chat

Date and Time: Monday, June 2 6:00 pm - 7:00 pm

Address: 392 Queen St., Blyth ON

Drop into the Blyth Branch on Monday evenings for Craft & Chat, a casual crafters’ get-together and a great op
portunity to meet new friends! Bring your crafting project and a refreshment or coffee is available by donation.

Not offered on the 4th Monday of the month.

This is a drop-in program, no registration is necessary.

Tuesday, June 3, 2025

FREE Community Volunteer Income Tax Program (CVITP) Clinic

Date and Time: Tuesday, June 3 9:00 am - 1:00 pm

Address: 392 Queen Street, Blyth, ON, N0M 1H0

Get your benefits and credits - if you have a modest income and simple tax situation, you can get help from a tr
ained volunteer to do your tax return for FREE.  Clinic takes place at the Blyth Library (392 Queen Street) on 
Tuesdays, Fridays, and Saturdays, from 9 am - 1 pm, by appointment only.  Contact Fred Vandersterre to book 
your appointment - 519.887.9506 or fvandersterre@gmail.com.

Wednesday, June 4, 2025

Tai Chi

Date and Time: Wednesday, June 4 10:30 am - 11:30 am

Address: 281 Edward St., Wingham ON

Join us at the Alice Munro Branch for a Tai Chi session, all skill levels welcome!

This program is run by community volunteers and is a drop-in program, so no registration is necessary.

Thursday, June 5, 2025

https://www.huroncountylibrary.ca/blyth-branch/
https://www.huroncountylibrary.ca/alice-munro-library-branch/


Card Night

Date and Time: Thursday, June 5 6:00 pm - 7:00 pm

Address: 392 Queen St., Blyth ON

Drop into the Blyth Branch each Thursday for an evening of cards. Play a familiar game of cards, or learn a new
one, and have some fun at the library!

Friday, June 6, 2025

FREE Community Volunteer Income Tax Program (CVITP) Clinic

Date and Time: Friday, June 6 9:00 am - 1:00 pm

Address: 392 Queen Street, Blyth, ON, N0M 1H0

Get your benefits and credits - if you have a modest income and simple tax situation, you can get help from a tr
ained volunteer to do your tax return for FREE.  Clinic takes place at the Blyth Library (392 Queen Street) on 
Tuesdays, Fridays, and Saturdays, from 9 am - 1 pm, by appointment only.  Contact Fred Vandersterre to book 
your appointment - 519.887.9506 or fvandersterre@gmail.com.

Play & Learn

Date and Time: Friday, June 6 10:00 am - 11:30 am

Address: 281 Edward St., Wingham ON

Join Huron EarlyON each Friday morning at the Alice Munro Branch for free programs designed for parents/ca
regivers and children from birth to six years old. Enjoy age-appropriate activities, discover answers to questions
on child development, find information about programs and services that are available for young children and f
amilies in their area, and talk to EarlyON Professionals, as well as other parents and caregivers in the communit
y.

Registration required – to register online, visit: www.keyon.ca

FREE Community Volunteer Income Tax Program (CVITP) Clinic

Date and Time: Friday, June 6 10:00 am - 4:00 pm

Address: 281 Edward Street, Wingham, ON, N0G 2W0

Get your benefits and credits - if you have a modest income and simple tax situation, you can get help from a tr
ained volunteer to do your tax return for FREE.  Clinic takes place at the Wingham Library (281 Edward Street
) on on Fridays, 10 am - 4 pm, by appointment only.  Contact Fred Vandersterre to book your appointment - 5
19-887-9506 or fvandersterre@gmail.com.

https://www.huroncountylibrary.ca/blyth-branch/
https://www.huroncounty.ca/social-services/childrens-services
https://www.huroncountylibrary.ca/alice-munro-library-branch/
https://www.keyon.ca/


Tech Time

Date and Time: Friday, June 6 2:00 pm - 4:00 pm

Address: 281 Edward St., Wingham ON

The Alice Munro Branch, Wingham, hosts Tech Time each Friday afternoon. Book a 30-minute session to recei
ve one-on-one help with library e-resources, your device, and/or your email account. Lessons are limited to the 
technical knowledge of library staff. Hardware issues or highly specific questions may require the assistance of 
qualified computer service technicians.

Registration Required. To register for this in-person program, contact the branch by calling 519-357-3312 or e
mailing winghamlibrary@huroncounty.ca.

Saturday, June 7, 2025

Belgrave Yard sale

Date and Time: Saturday, June 7 7:00 am - 1:00 pm

Address: Queen Street Belgrave

Annual Yard sale, BBQ and bottle drive to fundraise for the Belgrave Community Playground

Belgrave Community Yard Sale and BBQ (11.00am-1.00pm)

Date and Time: Saturday, June 7 8:00 am - 1:00 pm

Address: 12 Queen Street

The Belgrave Community is hosting a village wide yard sale with proceeds going to the Belgrave Playground F
undraising Project! The Playground Committee is hosting a BBQ between 11 am and 1 pm by donation, also pr
oceeds going to the Playground Fundraising Project.

FREE Community Volunteer Income Tax Program (CVITP) Clinic

Date and Time: Saturday, June 7 9:00 am - 1:00 pm

Address: 392 Queen Street, Blyth, ON, N0M 1H0

Get your benefits and credits - if you have a modest income and simple tax situation, you can get help from a tr
ained volunteer to do your tax return for FREE.  Clinic takes place at the Blyth Library (392 Queen Street) on 
Tuesdays, Fridays, and Saturdays, from 9 am - 1 pm, by appointment only.  Contact Fred Vandersterre to book 
your appointment - 519.887.9506 or fvandersterre@gmail.com.

Cricut Afternoon

Date and Time: Saturday, June 7 10:30 am - 11:30 am

https://www.huroncountylibrary.ca/alice-munro-library-branch/
mailto:winghamlibrary@huroncounty.ca


Address: 281 Edward St., Wingham ON

Join us at the Alice Munro Branch – Wingham to create a project with the Library’s Cricut.

This is a program for teens and adults.

REGISTRATION: Contact the branch by email at winghamlibrary@huroncounty.ca or call 519-357-3312

Monday, June 9, 2025

Crafters Circle : Craft and Chat

Date and Time: Monday, June 9 6:00 pm - 7:00 pm

Address: 392 Queen St., Blyth ON

Drop into the Blyth Branch on Monday evenings for Craft & Chat, a casual crafters’ get-together and a great op
portunity to meet new friends! Bring your crafting project and a refreshment or coffee is available by donation.

Not offered on the 4th Monday of the month.

This is a drop-in program, no registration is necessary.

Tuesday, June 10, 2025

FREE Community Volunteer Income Tax Program (CVITP) Clinic

Date and Time: Tuesday, June 10 9:00 am - 1:00 pm

Address: 392 Queen Street, Blyth, ON, N0M 1H0

Get your benefits and credits - if you have a modest income and simple tax situation, you can get help from a tr
ained volunteer to do your tax return for FREE.  Clinic takes place at the Blyth Library (392 Queen Street) on 
Tuesdays, Fridays, and Saturdays, from 9 am - 1 pm, by appointment only.  Contact Fred Vandersterre to book 
your appointment - 519.887.9506 or fvandersterre@gmail.com.

Virtual Reality Free Play

Date and Time: Tuesday, June 10 3:00 pm - 5:00 pm

Address: 281 Edward St., Wingham ON

Join us at the Alice Munro Branch to Discover the Huron County Library’s Virtual Reality headsets by booking
a 1 hour session.

Participants can dive into the action with games like Beat Saber, explore the globe through immersive travel ex
periences, enjoy a relaxing round of mini golf, meditate in serene virtual environments, and so much more!

https://www.huroncountylibrary.ca/alice-munro-library-branch/
https://www.huroncountylibrary.ca/tech-at-the-library/
mailto:winghamlibrary@huroncounty.ca
https://www.huroncountylibrary.ca/blyth-branch/
https://www.huroncountylibrary.ca/alice-munro-library-branch/


AGES: 13+

REGISTRATION REQUIRED: Contact the branch by email at winghamlibrary@huroncounty.ca or by callin
g 519-357-3312 to book your 1 hour VR experience.

Wednesday, June 11, 2025

Tai Chi

Date and Time: Wednesday, June 11 10:30 am - 11:30 am

Address: 281 Edward St., Wingham ON

Join us at the Alice Munro Branch for a Tai Chi session, all skill levels welcome!

This program is run by community volunteers and is a drop-in program, so no registration is necessary.

Thursday, June 12, 2025

Virtual Reality Free Play

Date and Time: Thursday, June 12 3:30 pm - 5:30 pm

Address: 392 Queen St., Blyth ON

Join us at the Blyth Library to Discover the Huron County Library’s Virtual Reality headsets by booking a 1 ho
ur session.

Participants can dive into the action with games like Beat Saber, explore the globe through immersive travel ex
periences, enjoy a relaxing round of mini golf, meditate in serene virtual environments, and so much more!

AGES: 13+

REGISTRATION REQUIRED: Contact the branch by email at blythlibrary@huroncounty.caor by calling 519
-523-4400 to book your 1 hour VR experience.

Card Night

Date and Time: Thursday, June 12 6:00 pm - 7:00 pm

Address: 392 Queen St., Blyth ON

Drop into the Blyth Branch each Thursday for an evening of cards. Play a familiar game of cards, or learn a new
one, and have some fun at the library!

Friday, June 13, 2025

mailto:winghamlibrary@huroncounty.ca
https://www.huroncountylibrary.ca/alice-munro-library-branch/
https://www.huroncountylibrary.ca/blyth-branch/
mailto:blythlibrary@huroncounty.ca
https://www.huroncountylibrary.ca/blyth-branch/


FREE Community Volunteer Income Tax Program (CVITP) Clinic

Date and Time: Friday, June 13 9:00 am - 1:00 pm

Address: 392 Queen Street, Blyth, ON, N0M 1H0

Get your benefits and credits - if you have a modest income and simple tax situation, you can get help from a tr
ained volunteer to do your tax return for FREE.  Clinic takes place at the Blyth Library (392 Queen Street) on 
Tuesdays, Fridays, and Saturdays, from 9 am - 1 pm, by appointment only.  Contact Fred Vandersterre to book 
your appointment - 519.887.9506 or fvandersterre@gmail.com.

Play & Learn

Date and Time: Friday, June 13 10:00 am - 11:30 am

Address: 281 Edward St., Wingham ON

Join Huron EarlyON each Friday morning at the Alice Munro Branch for free programs designed for parents/ca
regivers and children from birth to six years old. Enjoy age-appropriate activities, discover answers to questions
on child development, find information about programs and services that are available for young children and f
amilies in their area, and talk to EarlyON Professionals, as well as other parents and caregivers in the communit
y.

Registration required – to register online, visit: www.keyon.ca

FREE Community Volunteer Income Tax Program (CVITP) Clinic

Date and Time: Friday, June 13 10:00 am - 4:00 pm

Address: 281 Edward Street, Wingham, ON, N0G 2W0

Get your benefits and credits - if you have a modest income and simple tax situation, you can get help from a tr
ained volunteer to do your tax return for FREE.  Clinic takes place at the Wingham Library (281 Edward Street
) on on Fridays, 10 am - 4 pm, by appointment only.  Contact Fred Vandersterre to book your appointment - 5
19-887-9506 or fvandersterre@gmail.com.

Afternoon Book Club

Date and Time: Friday, June 13 1:15 pm - 2:15 pm

Address: 281 Edward St., Wingham ON

Join us at the Alice Munro Branch for Afternoon Book Club. Participants share and summarize their latest read
s.

This is a drop-in Program. No registration is required.

Tech Time

https://www.huroncounty.ca/social-services/childrens-services
https://www.huroncountylibrary.ca/alice-munro-library-branch/
https://www.keyon.ca/
https://www.huroncountylibrary.ca/alice-munro-library-branch/


Date and Time: Friday, June 13 2:00 pm - 4:00 pm

Address: 281 Edward St., Wingham ON

The Alice Munro Branch, Wingham, hosts Tech Time each Friday afternoon. Book a 30-minute session to recei
ve one-on-one help with library e-resources, your device, and/or your email account. Lessons are limited to the 
technical knowledge of library staff. Hardware issues or highly specific questions may require the assistance of 
qualified computer service technicians.

Registration Required. To register for this in-person program, contact the branch by calling 519-357-3312 or e
mailing winghamlibrary@huroncounty.ca.

Musical Muskrat Festival

Date and Time: Friday, June 13 6:45 pm

Address: Riverside Park

Live Music and more by the Maitland Shore.

 

Live music Friday night and Saturday. Fantastic Fun Zone, Dunk Tank and Muskrat Market Saturday.

All events held at Riverside Park Wingham!!

 

You can find a full schedule of events on our Facebook page.

Saturday, June 14, 2025

FREE Community Volunteer Income Tax Program (CVITP) Clinic

Date and Time: Saturday, June 14 9:00 am - 1:00 pm

Address: 392 Queen Street, Blyth, ON, N0M 1H0

Get your benefits and credits - if you have a modest income and simple tax situation, you can get help from a tr
ained volunteer to do your tax return for FREE.  Clinic takes place at the Blyth Library (392 Queen Street) on 
Tuesdays, Fridays, and Saturdays, from 9 am - 1 pm, by appointment only.  Contact Fred Vandersterre to book 
your appointment - 519.887.9506 or fvandersterre@gmail.com.

Musical Muskrat Festival

Date and Time: Saturday, June 14 11:40 am

Address: Riverside Park

https://www.huroncountylibrary.ca/alice-munro-library-branch/
mailto:winghamlibrary@huroncounty.ca


Live Music and more by the Maitland Shore.

 

Live music Friday night and Saturday. Fantastic Fun Zone, Dunk Tank and Muskrat Market Saturday.

All events held at Riverside Park Wingham!!

 

You can find a full schedule of events on our Facebook page.

Monday, June 16, 2025

Crafters Circle : Craft and Chat

Date and Time: Monday, June 16 6:00 pm - 7:00 pm

Address: 392 Queen St., Blyth ON

Drop into the Blyth Branch on Monday evenings for Craft & Chat, a casual crafters’ get-together and a great op
portunity to meet new friends! Bring your crafting project and a refreshment or coffee is available by donation.

Not offered on the 4th Monday of the month.

This is a drop-in program, no registration is necessary.

Tuesday, June 17, 2025

FREE Community Volunteer Income Tax Program (CVITP) Clinic

Date and Time: Tuesday, June 17 9:00 am - 1:00 pm

Address: 392 Queen Street, Blyth, ON, N0M 1H0

Get your benefits and credits - if you have a modest income and simple tax situation, you can get help from a tr
ained volunteer to do your tax return for FREE.  Clinic takes place at the Blyth Library (392 Queen Street) on 
Tuesdays, Fridays, and Saturdays, from 9 am - 1 pm, by appointment only.  Contact Fred Vandersterre to book 
your appointment - 519.887.9506 or fvandersterre@gmail.com.

Wednesday, June 18, 2025

Tai Chi

Date and Time: Wednesday, June 18 10:30 am - 11:30 am

https://www.huroncountylibrary.ca/blyth-branch/


Address: 281 Edward St., Wingham ON

Join us at the Alice Munro Branch for a Tai Chi session, all skill levels welcome!

This program is run by community volunteers and is a drop-in program, so no registration is necessary.

Thursday, June 19, 2025

Card Night

Date and Time: Thursday, June 19 6:00 pm - 7:00 pm

Address: 392 Queen St., Blyth ON

Drop into the Blyth Branch each Thursday for an evening of cards. Play a familiar game of cards, or learn a new
one, and have some fun at the library!

Friday, June 20, 2025

FREE Community Volunteer Income Tax Program (CVITP) Clinic

Date and Time: Friday, June 20 9:00 am - 1:00 pm

Address: 392 Queen Street, Blyth, ON, N0M 1H0

Get your benefits and credits - if you have a modest income and simple tax situation, you can get help from a tr
ained volunteer to do your tax return for FREE.  Clinic takes place at the Blyth Library (392 Queen Street) on 
Tuesdays, Fridays, and Saturdays, from 9 am - 1 pm, by appointment only.  Contact Fred Vandersterre to book 
your appointment - 519.887.9506 or fvandersterre@gmail.com.

Play & Learn

Date and Time: Friday, June 20 10:00 am - 11:30 am

Address: 281 Edward St., Wingham ON

Join Huron EarlyON each Friday morning at the Alice Munro Branch for free programs designed for parents/ca
regivers and children from birth to six years old. Enjoy age-appropriate activities, discover answers to questions
on child development, find information about programs and services that are available for young children and f
amilies in their area, and talk to EarlyON Professionals, as well as other parents and caregivers in the communit
y.

Registration required – to register online, visit: www.keyon.ca

FREE Community Volunteer Income Tax Program (CVITP) Clinic

https://www.huroncountylibrary.ca/alice-munro-library-branch/
https://www.huroncountylibrary.ca/blyth-branch/
https://www.huroncounty.ca/social-services/childrens-services
https://www.huroncountylibrary.ca/alice-munro-library-branch/
https://www.keyon.ca/


Date and Time: Friday, June 20 10:00 am - 4:00 pm

Address: 281 Edward Street, Wingham, ON, N0G 2W0

Get your benefits and credits - if you have a modest income and simple tax situation, you can get help from a tr
ained volunteer to do your tax return for FREE.  Clinic takes place at the Wingham Library (281 Edward Street
) on on Fridays, 10 am - 4 pm, by appointment only.  Contact Fred Vandersterre to book your appointment - 5
19-887-9506 or fvandersterre@gmail.com.

Tech Time

Date and Time: Friday, June 20 2:00 pm - 4:00 pm

Address: 281 Edward St., Wingham ON

The Alice Munro Branch, Wingham, hosts Tech Time each Friday afternoon. Book a 30-minute session to recei
ve one-on-one help with library e-resources, your device, and/or your email account. Lessons are limited to the 
technical knowledge of library staff. Hardware issues or highly specific questions may require the assistance of 
qualified computer service technicians.

Registration Required. To register for this in-person program, contact the branch by calling 519-357-3312 or e
mailing winghamlibrary@huroncounty.ca.

Saturday, June 21, 2025

United Way Perth Huron - Northern Huron Connection Centre - Brunch N' Learn
Event

Date and Time: Saturday, June 21 8:00 am - 10:00 am

Address: 23 John Street, Wingham

Please join us for our Brunch N' Learn Event on Saturday, June 21, 2025 at the Northern Huron Connection C
entre (23 John Street, Wingham) - https://www.facebook.com/profile.php?id=61564932186592 Running from
8 am - 10 am, this event will feature a full hot breakfast and drinks, sharing of Connection Centre community r
ole and impact. Connection Centre tours, and door prizes.  Cost is $25 per person - please RSVP by June 16, 2
025 to Lisa Harper - lharper@perthhuron.unitedway.ca, 519.357.6795.  Everyone welcome!

FREE Community Volunteer Income Tax Program (CVITP) Clinic

Date and Time: Saturday, June 21 9:00 am - 1:00 pm

Address: 392 Queen Street, Blyth, ON, N0M 1H0

Get your benefits and credits - if you have a modest income and simple tax situation, you can get help from a tr
ained volunteer to do your tax return for FREE.  Clinic takes place at the Blyth Library (392 Queen Street) on 
Tuesdays, Fridays, and Saturdays, from 9 am - 1 pm, by appointment only.  Contact Fred Vandersterre to book 
your appointment - 519.887.9506 or fvandersterre@gmail.com.

https://www.huroncountylibrary.ca/alice-munro-library-branch/
mailto:winghamlibrary@huroncounty.ca
https://www.facebook.com/profile.php?id=61564932186592
mailto:lharper@perthhuron.unitedway.ca


Belgrave has talent

Date and Time: Saturday, June 21 4:30 pm - 9:30 pm

Address: Queen Street Belgrave

Talent show, steak dinner($50, children hamburger $15)and silent auction. Come out and support the Belgrave 
playground committee and show of your talents!

Monday, June 23, 2025

Book Club

Date and Time: Monday, June 23 6:00 pm - 7:00 pm

Address: 392 Queen St., Blyth ON

Join us at the Blyth Branch for a casual monthly discussion of a specific book.  Adults are welcome to join the 
club, which runs the Last Monday of each month. For more information, or to register, please contact the branc
h. This group is community-led and facilitated by group members.

Please contact the Blyth Branch by email blythlibrary@huroncounty.ca or by phone 519-523-4400 to register.

Tuesday, June 24, 2025

FREE Community Volunteer Income Tax Program (CVITP) Clinic

Date and Time: Tuesday, June 24 9:00 am - 1:00 pm

Address: 392 Queen Street, Blyth, ON, N0M 1H0

Get your benefits and credits - if you have a modest income and simple tax situation, you can get help from a tr
ained volunteer to do your tax return for FREE.  Clinic takes place at the Blyth Library (392 Queen Street) on 
Tuesdays, Fridays, and Saturdays, from 9 am - 1 pm, by appointment only.  Contact Fred Vandersterre to book 
your appointment - 519.887.9506 or fvandersterre@gmail.com.

Wednesday, June 25, 2025

Tai Chi

Date and Time: Wednesday, June 25 10:30 am - 11:30 am

Address: 281 Edward St., Wingham ON

Join us at the Alice Munro Branch for a Tai Chi session, all skill levels welcome!

https://www.huroncountylibrary.ca/blyth-branch/
mailto:blythlibrary@huroncounty.ca
https://www.huroncountylibrary.ca/alice-munro-library-branch/


This program is run by community volunteers and is a drop-in program, so no registration is necessary.

Thursday, June 26, 2025

Let's Learn with Community Teachers

Date and Time: Thursday, June 26 4:00 pm - 5:00 pm

Address: 392 Queen St., Blyth ON

Join us at the Blyth Branch once a month to gain knowledge and skills from one of our community teachers thr
ough various learning methods.

Upcoming sessions:

April 24 – Dancing with Les and Anne
May 22 – Candle Making at Penny’s
June 26 – Tech Toys with Hamilton

AGES: 6+

Registration recommended.Please contact the Blyth Branch by email blythlibrary@huroncounty.ca or by phon
e 519-523-4400 to register.

Card Night

Date and Time: Thursday, June 26 6:00 pm - 7:00 pm

Address: 392 Queen St., Blyth ON

Drop into the Blyth Branch each Thursday for an evening of cards. Play a familiar game of cards, or learn a new
one, and have some fun at the library!

Friday, June 27, 2025

FREE Community Volunteer Income Tax Program (CVITP) Clinic

Date and Time: Friday, June 27 9:00 am - 1:00 pm

Address: 392 Queen Street, Blyth, ON, N0M 1H0

Get your benefits and credits - if you have a modest income and simple tax situation, you can get help from a tr
ained volunteer to do your tax return for FREE.  Clinic takes place at the Blyth Library (392 Queen Street) on 
Tuesdays, Fridays, and Saturdays, from 9 am - 1 pm, by appointment only.  Contact Fred Vandersterre to book 
your appointment - 519.887.9506 or fvandersterre@gmail.com.

https://www.huroncountylibrary.ca/blyth-branch/
mailto:blythlibrary@huroncounty.ca
https://www.huroncountylibrary.ca/blyth-branch/


Play & Learn

Date and Time: Friday, June 27 10:00 am - 11:30 am

Address: 281 Edward St., Wingham ON

Join Huron EarlyON each Friday morning at the Alice Munro Branch for free programs designed for parents/ca
regivers and children from birth to six years old. Enjoy age-appropriate activities, discover answers to questions
on child development, find information about programs and services that are available for young children and f
amilies in their area, and talk to EarlyON Professionals, as well as other parents and caregivers in the communit
y.

Registration required – to register online, visit: www.keyon.ca

FREE Community Volunteer Income Tax Program (CVITP) Clinic

Date and Time: Friday, June 27 10:00 am - 4:00 pm

Address: 281 Edward Street, Wingham, ON, N0G 2W0

Get your benefits and credits - if you have a modest income and simple tax situation, you can get help from a tr
ained volunteer to do your tax return for FREE.  Clinic takes place at the Wingham Library (281 Edward Street
) on on Fridays, 10 am - 4 pm, by appointment only.  Contact Fred Vandersterre to book your appointment - 5
19-887-9506 or fvandersterre@gmail.com.

Tech Time

Date and Time: Friday, June 27 2:00 pm - 4:00 pm

Address: 281 Edward St., Wingham ON

The Alice Munro Branch, Wingham, hosts Tech Time each Friday afternoon. Book a 30-minute session to recei
ve one-on-one help with library e-resources, your device, and/or your email account. Lessons are limited to the 
technical knowledge of library staff. Hardware issues or highly specific questions may require the assistance of 
qualified computer service technicians.

Registration Required. To register for this in-person program, contact the branch by calling 519-357-3312 or e
mailing winghamlibrary@huroncounty.ca.

Saturday, June 28, 2025

FREE Community Volunteer Income Tax Program (CVITP) Clinic

Date and Time: Saturday, June 28 9:00 am - 1:00 pm

Address: 392 Queen Street, Blyth, ON, N0M 1H0

Get your benefits and credits - if you have a modest income and simple tax situation, you can get help from a tr
ained volunteer to do your tax return for FREE.  Clinic takes place at the Blyth Library (392 Queen Street) on 

https://www.huroncounty.ca/social-services/childrens-services
https://www.huroncountylibrary.ca/alice-munro-library-branch/
https://www.keyon.ca/
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https://calendar.northhuron.ca

Tuesdays, Fridays, and Saturdays, from 9 am - 1 pm, by appointment only.  Contact Fred Vandersterre to book 
your appointment - 519.887.9506 or fvandersterre@gmail.com.

4th Annual Touch A Truck

Date and Time: Saturday, June 28 11:00 am - 4:00 pm

Address: 21 Lloyd St, Wingham, ON, N0G 2W0

Hutton Heights Community Church and Jamie Fischer ReMax are partnering to bring you our 4th Annual Touc
h A Truck. This is a day of fun where you and your kids can sit in an amazing truck, vehicle, tractor, and cool ca
rs. This year we have a helicopter flying in. There will be quad rides and kids side-by-side rides available. Face p
ainting provided by The Faith Mission Canada, and Brammy's Food Truck will be on site as well. Please bring i
n food or money donations to help build up the North Huron Food Share. 

Sunday, June 29, 2025

Canada Day Fireworks

Date and Time: Sunday, June 29 9:00 pm - 9:30 pm

Address: 145 Park Drive Wingham

Fireworks will be displayed at DUSK.

Monday, June 30, 2025

Crafters Circle : Craft and Chat

Date and Time: Monday, June 30 6:00 pm - 7:00 pm

Address: 392 Queen St., Blyth ON

Drop into the Blyth Branch on Monday evenings for Craft & Chat, a casual crafters’ get-together and a great op
portunity to meet new friends! Bring your crafting project and a refreshment or coffee is available by donation.

Not offered on the 4th Monday of the month.

This is a drop-in program, no registration is necessary.

https://www.huroncountylibrary.ca/blyth-branch/
https://calendar.northhuron.ca

